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Preface 
 
Since the early 1990s, the volume of the world trade has grown rapidly. The increase in 
trading intermediate goods has been cited as a possible factor explaining world trade 
growth. In East Asia, the volume of the trade has had significant growth and the striking 
fact is that intermediate goods trade in East Asia deepens much more than that in the 
world. Intermediate goods trade increases as a result of vertical production network in 
which production processes are sliced into many stages and location of production 
stages are stretching across countries. This phenomenon is called as vertical 
specialization, production fragmentation, and production networks. It is pointed out that 
East Asia is the region which hosts the most such production system from the fact that it 
increases intermediate goods trade significantly. In order to investigate the phenomenon 
in East Asia, we conducted a project “Vertical Specialization and Economic Integration 
in East Asia” at the Institute of Developing Economies, Japan External Trade 
Organization (JETRO).  

This is an interim report of the project and contains seven chapters. Chapter 1 
calculates vertical specialization indices, and finds that vertical specialization is 
increasing in East Asia. Chapter 2 proposes the concept of four layers of fragmentation: 
local, sub-regional, regional and world, and intend to bridge geographical distances and 
the nature of transaction in terms of intra-firms vs. arm’s-length as well as 
technological/managerial conditions. Chapter 3 studies the structure of parts and 
components trade in East Asia, and measures the impact of production networks and free 
trade agreements on East Asia’s bilateral part and component trade. Chapter 4 
investigates vertical production networks by examining behavior of Japanese firms. 
Chapter 5 discusses the characteristics of production fragmentation in East Asia by using 
case study results. Chapter 6 discusses the possibility of extension of vertical production 
networks in Laos. Chapter 7 measures competitiveness and discusses the linkage 
between competitiveness and resources.   
 This research project will be continued next fiscal year (April 2008 to March 
2009). We aim to provide proper policies in order to increase international intermediate 
goods trade, consequently, promote economic integration in the region in the final 
reports. We hope that this report will be helpful for the reader to understand cause of the 
increase in intermediate goods trade and vertical specialization in East Asia.  
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